
$2,790,000 - 177 OSPREY HEIGHTS Road
 

Listing ID: 40562402

$2,790,000
4 Bedrooms, 3 Bathrooms, 2.8 acres
Single Family

177 OSPREY HEIGHTS Road, Grey
Highlands, Ontario, N0C1M0

Nestled amidst breathtaking natural beauty,
this remarkable gem offers a truly priceless
vista overlooking the serene Pretty River
Valley and the stunning expanse of
Georgian Bay. Enjoy unparalleled privacy
in this secluded haven, where tranquility
reigns supreme. Conveniently situated near
the renowned Devil's Glen Ski Club and the
town of Collingwood, adventure and leisure
activities are never far away. Step inside this
meticulously crafted abode to discover a
showcase of quality craftsmanship at every
turn. Fully furnished and equipped, this
home is a 100% turnkey retreat - simply
pack your essentials and settle in to enjoy
the luxurious lifestyle it offers. Outside,
mature gardens envelop the property,
creating a tranquil sanctuary for relaxation
and contemplation. Ample outdoor living
spaces beckon, perfect for entertaining
guests or simply soaking in the natural
splendor. Embrace the epitome of refined
living in this extraordinary property, where
the beauty of the surroundings harmonizes
seamlessly with the comfort and elegance of
the home. (id:50245)
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