
$669,000 - 61 COUNTRY Crescent
 

Listing ID: 40565579

$669,000
3 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 2200
Single Family

61 COUNTRY Crescent, Meaford, Ontario,
N4L1L7

Curb appeal galore at 61 Country Crescent.
This charming raised bungalow is located in
the quiet neighbourhood of Ridge Creek
Development. The home has 2 +1 bedrooms
and open concept living, dining, kitchen
area with walk-out to deck overlooking
quaint back yard and large garden/artist
bunkie. Bedrooms are spacious with full
closets and closet organizers. New laminate
has been laid on upper level as well as the
replacement of some lighting fixtures. With
over 2200 sq. ft. of finished living space
with family room, extra bedroom and three
piece washroom on lower level there is lots
of room for friends and family. The
backyard faces north and is private and
landscaped with over three patio sitting
areas. Meaford is a beautiful town with a
marina, library, quaint shops and wonderful
restaurants. (id:50245)
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